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42 And they devoted themselves to the apostles' teaching and the fellowship, to the 
breaking of bread and the prayers. 43 And awe came upon every soul, and many 
wonders and signs were being done through the apostles. 44 And all who believed were 
together and had all things in common. 45 And they were selling their possessions and 
belongings and distributing the proceeds to all, as any had need. 46 And day by day, 
attending the temple together and breaking bread in their homes, they received their 
food with glad and generous hearts, 47 praising God and having favor with all the 
people. And the Lord added to their number day by day those who were being saved. 
Acts 2:42-47 

Prayer Is Powerful Because: 
1) What God Does For Us 

Is anyone among you suffering? Let him pray. Is anyone cheerful? Let him sing praise. 
14 Is anyone among you sick? Let him call for the elders of the church, and let them 
pray over him, anointing him with oil in the name of the Lord. James 5:13-14 

Therefore, confess your sins to one another and pray for one another, that you may be 
healed. The prayer of a righteous person has great power as it is working. 17 Elijah was 
a man with a nature like ours, and he prayed fervently that it might not rain, and for 
three years and six months it did not rain on the earth. 18 Then he prayed again, and 
heaven gave rain, and the earth bore its fruit. James 5:16-18 

2) What God Does In Us 

Clothe yourselves, all of you, with humility toward one another, for “God opposes the 
proud but gives grace to the humble.” 6 Humble yourselves, therefore, under the mighty 
hand of God so that at the proper time he may exalt you, 7 casting all your anxieties on 
him, because he cares for you. 1 Peter 5:5b-7 

3) God Gets The Glory 

“Truly, truly, I say to you, whoever believes in me will also do the works that I do; and 
greater works than these will he do, because I am going to the Father. 13 Whatever you 
ask in my name, this I will do, that the Father may be glorified in the Son. 14 If you ask 
me anything in my name, I will do it. John 14:12-14 

7 If you abide in me, and my words abide in you, ask whatever you wish, and it will be 
done for you. 8 By this my Father is glorified, that you bear much fruit and so prove to 
be my disciples. John 15:7-8 

• YOU MUST HAVE AN HONEST RELATIONSHIP WITH GOD THROUGH CHRIST. 

31 We know that God does not listen to sinners, but if anyone is a worshiper of God and 
does his will, God listens to him. John 9:31


